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MADISON COUNTY

EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

Date:

To:

From:

Re:

601-859-4188 ® Fax: 601-859-4743 @ 125 West North Street ® Post Office Box 608 ® Canton, Mississippi 39046

Butch Hammack, Director ® bhammack@madison-co.com

March 8§, 2013

Madison County Board of Supervisors

Butch Hammack @

Road Claim
Industrial
Eric R. Dawson

Our office received a road claim for Eric Dawson on February 11, 2013. We have investigated
the incident and it is our office’s recommendation that this claim be paid in the amount of
$518.91. Through our investigation, we found the road is in need of several repairs. Our
findings will be forwarded to the Madison County Road Dept.

Attached is paperwork regarding the claim for your viewing.



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT
In order to process claim, please print & fill out completely, then return to Madison County Road Dept. or
Madison Co. EMA office along with two signed estimates for damages being claimed.
\
P 1
esonal [ QNS
Information P 'Q Q
Name: __{_fI¢ ™\« WS e
Mailing Address
’ y (_’I\( oaq ‘9(\/
Camten, MS 725045
Contact #: /O/){ V)DI ’% Xg\tq
Make/ Model of Vehicle /9()0(0 QMP\A/ kan&)q
Incident Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being
- reported: l \
nformation r
T Date: Q & ); Time: \&\L)P/V\ Q(:SO"HO‘UD
Location: \%«\ .x/ Qr’\(\ Q(\ _
(name of road incident occurred)
Area Landmarks: ¢ %Cw\%/\ &( L\D(\&MQ‘IY] Rf’brém*—
Approx. Speed at time of incident: L‘\ 5 L
Direction of Travel: g@ui\»\
Cause of Incident: ?ﬁlf 7,'"('0"9
(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)
Area of vehicle damaged: R}QX\/\\— j(?/é/\'\‘ QCQ[&T\(Q
Incident Please write a brief summary of’the incident (use back if needed):
Summary 'H‘C\(\,té__ 50‘«\% o &‘\\{’l V\Mé, Q\é
&w\ o o Bt Yele Py Cacked
by Q\BM— font Oheel - éwv(cg e
L

Date Received:

OFFICE USE ONLY:

__ Received by: ‘ Dept:

v




Quote #58059
Big 10 Tire & Accessories

110 Dees Drive, Madison, MS 38110
Phone: (601) 607-5151 Fax: (601) 607-5126
www.big10tiresms.com

" Street Smart Since 1952 "

Customer Information " _ = lEer herQuoters :
ERIC DAWSON , Date: 2/11/2013 PO Number:
1847 LORING RD. . Reference: Q-58059 Work Orderi#:
CAMDEN, MS 39045
i Salesperson: Rick Jones Waiting:
Acct Number: 601-573-8219 Status:
Route:
Delivery Date: 2/11/2013 Entered By: Rick Jones
Vehicle: 2006 Chevrolet Impala LS Lic No: NA Unit: Mileage:

VIN:NA Desc: () TPMS Equipped

~Qty. |'Description 7., . o Y.
400 9162813, 5X114.3 /120, Massive 916 5-4.5/120 +35

1,199.96
4,00 LEX2553520, 255/3520, Lexani LX-6 579.96
4.00 Mount & Balance - Aftermarket 119.96
1.00 5355K86, 12x1.5 Open End Bulge 5&6 Lug Install Kit 39.99

Taxable ,039.87..

135.79

Terms: N/A $2,075.66 |
Terms: | ol AmtRemagrP
$2,075.66
Account Balance | - 17 029Days | . 30-59Days’ i90+Days |
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 |
| Tivee B4
 eedace$ 2477
| ey lﬂgﬂﬁi ‘
9L 3 1
Tl
$1,819.91 $119.96 $1,939.87 $135.79 $0.00 $2,075.66 J

" Thank You for your Business " .
{ hereby authorize the stated repair work to be done along with the necessary material, and hereby grant Big 10 Tire & Accessories permission to
operate the vehicle herein described on streets, highways or elsewhere for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is
hereby acknowledged on above vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. Big 10 Tire & Accessories is not responsible for loss or damage to

vehicles, or articles left in vehicles, in case of fire, theft or any other cause beyond it's control.

Expiration Date: 3/13/2013
2/11/2013 12:52 PM Page: 1  Entered By: Rick Jones Signature




HARRELD CHEVROLET CO.
SALES AND SERVICE

Highway 51 South (eessons)
Jackson 354-2233  Canton 859-1611
Cam— Toll Free No: 1-800-451-3908

CANTON, MISSISSIPPI 38046
ES MATE OEREPAIRS-
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Lobore N ’ 2 Oi Hrs., @&E: @

Y Keep That Great GM Feeling $
Joend]  With Genuine GM Parts. ‘Parts § Less % s
$

| THANK YOU Sublet and}%rnem%%_&;_
% E QZ % GRAND TOTAL :_ﬁ)i@
Signed__« A

1o\ 397



Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>
Sent: Friday, March 08, 2013 4:00 PM

To: Shirley Brown (shirley.brown@madison-co.com)
Subject: Road Claim

We investigated claims on Sutherland Rd. and Industrial Rd., NE. Butch and Albert investigated and | also received the
report from Helen. We wanted to report to your department, that both of these roads have several repairs that are
needed. | wanted to pass that information along.

Thank you and have a great weekend!

Jennifer Taylor
Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office
0:601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



